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CLASSICAL AND
ANCIENT NEAR
EASTERN STUDIES

The widespread influence of Greece and Rome upon our own modern
society, the intrinsic attraction of ancient literature, civilization, and
material culture, and the interdisciplinary nature of the discipline make
classics a dynamic and popular field of study. Moreover, undergraduate
training in classics demands an intellectual rigor that can prepare students
for more advanced training in graduate school, supplement their studies in
a variety of other disciplines in the humanities, sciences, and engineering,
and help them gain admittance to professional programs in law and
medicine.

To this end, the Department of Classical and Ancient Near Eastern
Studies (CANES) offers three majors and a certificate, providing a number
of options for students wishing to explore their interests in classical
studies. The classical humanities major combines two semesters of
language study with elective coursework in literature and culture of the
ancient world. Students choose from a wide-variety of courses, including
everything from CLASSICS 150 Ancient Greek and Roman Monsters to
CLASSICS 308 Sex and Violence in the Ancient Near East. Students will
also find offerings in art, architecture, archaeology, gender studies, history,
literature, philosophy, and politics.

Latin and ancient Greek are regularly offered and provide the foundation
for modern English vocabulary, giving context and insight into the history
of the words we use today. Class sizes are small, making the experience
more personal and creating opportunities for meaningful learning
outcomes.

The department offers the classical studies certificate as well. This
15-credit certificate is designed with maximum flexibility in mind!
Coursework may be made up of literature and culture options only, or
some combination of language coursework may be included.

For more information about any of these options, please contact the
CANES department (http://canes.wisc.edu/).
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